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A
vances in medical

technology will be
critical to how well this
nation achievesits key

ealth policy objectives
of expanding access, improving
quality, and maintaining an afford­
able health care system. Advances
in medical scienceand their clinical
application have the potential to
eradicate some diseases, reduce the
burden of others, and improve the
process of care. If history is a
guide, new technologies also have
the potential to rapidly increase
medical care costs, forcing us to
confront difficult choices between
health care and other economic and
social goals.

New medical technology willbe
valuable to the extent that decisions
made by all stakeholders promote
the rapid diffusion of effectiveser­
vices and eliminate ineffectiveand
inappropriate uses. Those who sup­
port using evidence-basedmedicine
when making health care decisions
believethat the systematic develop­
ment, collection, and analysis of
good medical evidencecan help us
balance the cost and quality conse­
quences of new technology. Other
groups see evidence-based medi­
cine as an obstacle to the rapid
diffusion of technology. Unless a
consensus can be reached between
these competing positions, our
health care objectivesmay be very
difficult to attain.

At the Health Care Financing
Administration (HCFA), we under-

Steven H. Sheingold, Ph.D., is
director, Division ofProgram
Analysis and Performance
Measurement, at the Health Care
Financing Administration, in
Baltimore, Md. Sean Tunis, M.D.,
isdirector, Coverage and Analysis
Group, IttHCFA.

16

stand that health care professionals
who want to see rapid application of
new technologies, such as novel
radiation therapy equipment, may
be hesitant to purchase or use new
technologies becausetheyface
uncertaintiesabout reimbursement.
At the same time, we believe that
careful evaluationof medicaltech­
nology will become increasingly
acceptableas an integralpart of the
reimbursement processesof health
plans.Our beliefrests in the likeli­
hood that rapidly risinghealth care
costs along with the desire to
improve quality will promote the
use of explicit, objective methods
for making difficult choices.

The authority for making
coveragedecisions under Medicare
is defined under Section 1862
(a)(1)(A) of the SocialSecurity Act,
which requires that payment be
made only for items or services that
are "reasonable and necessary" for
the diagnosis and treatment of ill­
ness or injury. Coverage decisions
for new items and servicesunder
Medicare can be made either at the
local level by Medicare's contrac­
tors or at the national level by
HCFA. A small but growing num­
ber of decisions are now made at
the nationallevel, and interested
parties can participate in the
process. HCFA makes all docu­
ments available to the public,
includes input from a public advi­
sory committee, and makes its
decisions under timelines specified
in the public record.

The specific criteriafor deciding
whether an itemor serviceisreason­
ableand necessary haveyet to be
established formally through the
regulatory process.Still, the critical
Step in makingsuch decisionsisfor
HCFA to determine whether the
itemor serviceis medically effective,
meaningthat the benefitsto the
patient of the service exceedits risks.

To determine medical effective­
ness of new technology, HCFA
systematically collects and ana­
lyzes all data relevant to the inter­
vention. A number of methodolog­
ical issues are evaluated, including
patient outcomes (clinical mea­
sures, morbidity, mortality, health­
related quality of life, and func­
tional status), adequacy of sample
size, duration and completeness of
patient follow-up, and study
design. HCFA scrutinizes poten­
tial for bias when estimating the
impact of the technology on
patient outcomes. In general,
HCFA uses a hierarchy of study
designs for this purpose, with ran­
domized studies and other con­
trolled studies (e.g., case control,
comparison grour studies) having
the least potentia for bias.
Uncontrolled case series, case
reports, and informal consensus
methods carry higher risk of biased
results. HCFA carefully considers
data from all study designs and
evaluates their applicability to the
specific coverage decision.

HCFA recognizes that it is in
the interest of the Medicare pro­
gram to selectively use its reim­
bursement authority to support
research on clinical effectiveness.
Recently, HCFA issued a national
coverage policy to allow for the
reimbursement of routine patient
care costs in many high-quality
clinical trials. In a limited number
of cases(for example, lung volume
reduction surgery and carotid
angioplasry for stent placement),
HCFA has allowed for the pay­
ment of an otherwise non-covered
service under study within the pro­
tocol. Hopefully, efforts such as
these--combined with careful
review of the evidence for coverage
decisions-will improve the quality
of care and keep the Medicare
program affordable. t.fI
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